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Tour Summary 

 
Boston may be old and historic and 
Brahmin-fussy, but with half a million 
students infused into the mix each year, it 
has to stay young. So, our boutiques are 
trendy, our Red Sox and Fenway Park are 
the best in sports, our theater district now 
has dorms above a stage, and there's ballet 
in the old opera house. We dance over the 
Charles River, which has some bridges with 
funky traditions, and our food is way better 
than baked beans and cod. You want 
protests? Is the original Tea Party good 
enough? 
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Introduction 

 

 



 

 

Boston has everything except warm 
winters. This tour will take you down our 
most fashionable street, Newbury... 



 

 

...and across five of our bridges that span 
the Charles River. Each bridge has its own 
story... 



 

 

...and one of them is hilarious. 



 

 

We'll head into our beloved baseball field, 
Fenway Park, and... 



 

 

...down the Royal Mile in the theater district, 
so named because it was there when the 
city was still a colony under the British king. 



 

 

And we'll explore a few of our restaurants 
which, finally, have escalated from serving 
mainly baked beans and codfish to world-
class cuisine. 
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